
 
Quest Participant Agreement Form 

(to be read and signed by each participant and his/her guardian) 
  
 

1. The leaders from your church who are coming with your youth will serve as the primary supervisors and 
communicators for the youth from your church. The Quest leadership staff is a program staff.  
 

2. No drugs, No alcohol, No weapons, No vaping, No smoking on the grounds. Students or leaders found with any 
of these items will be asked to leave camp at their own expense. If asked to leave, the arrangements will be the 
responsibility of the student’s church and/or parents/guardians. 
 

3. No bulling, racism, physical violence, rude or inappropriate comments or conversations, inappropriate physical 
contact with other individuals, argumentative behavior, or breaking of camp rules. If this happens, the student 
will be separated from the group and may be asked to leave camp at their own expense. If asked to leave, the 
arrangements will be the responsibility of the student’s church and/or parents/guardians.  

 

4. Students are expected attend and participate in all scheduled Quest activities. If there is a change in the 
schedule it will be posted on the CYC doors and will be communicated with the church’s adult leaders. 

  

5. Swimming is not allowed without a Quest lifeguard present. All swimmers must follow swimming rules, pass a 
swimming test, and comply with all swimming rules. During free time students are welcome to enjoy the 
grounds, take a hike, or enjoy organized free-time activities. Quest does not facilitate or monitor boating of any 
kind. Students are expected to respect and follow the waterfront rules. Students unwilling to comply with safety 
rules will not be allowed to swim.  

 

6. Students should not be in other students’ rooms.  
 

7. Students must be in their dorms by 10:00 PM. The dorm lobbies close at 10:30 PM. Lights out is at 11 PM. 
(unless changes have been made by your church’s adult leaders or a special Quest activity). 

 

8. Student rooms must be kept clean. Please put all trash in the provided trash cans. Per Wisconsin state 
regulations, the sleeping arrangement guidelines posted in each room must be followed. Do not move furniture, 
adjust the hallway thermostat, or tamper with the smoke detectors. Damage done to any of the rooms or lobby 
will be charged to the church/parents of the students.  Each student will be provided a key for their room. That 
room key must be returned at the end of the week. If not returned, the student will be charged a fee for the lost 
room key.  

 

9. It is important that students care for themselves. Drink water, wear shoes outside and in the dining room. Use 
sunscreen. Water fountains are located in the CYC and water bottles are available for purchase at the Quest 
Store.  
 

10. Students and leaders are expected to respect other groups at the conference center and to follow the rules in 
the dining room and around the campgrounds.  

 

11. All medications must be turned in to the camp nurse (prescription and over-the-counter). If a medical 
emergency arises, the adult leaders from your church will contact the parent/guardian of the student. The adult 
leaders will also be responsible for transporting the student, should it be needed, to a medical facility for 
treatment.  
 

12. While on the high ropes, climbing tower, zip line, and low ropes, students will be expected to follow the 
directions of the Quest leadership staff. Students who are unwilling to listen and follow the safety guidelines will 
not be allowed to participate.  
 

By signing below, you are stating that you have read and understand this form. 
 
 
Signature of Student      Date     Signature of Parent  Date 


